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Celebrating 98 Years 
Community Day Homecoming Weekend August 15-17, 2025 

 

You’re invited to join The Way of the Cross Church of Christ, Inc., for a joyous  Community Day 
Homecoming Celebration commemorating 98th year of ministry since our founding in 1927. With hearts 
full of gratitude, we will also honor the life and legacy of our late founder, Bishop Henry Chauncey 
Brooks, on his birthday weekend. This three-day celebration will bring together members, alumni, 
neighbors, and friends for uplifting worship, fellowship, and family fun. All are welcome to share in the 
excitement as we reflect on our rich history and look ahead to a bright future for our church community! 

Celebration Schedule 

Friday, August 15 – Homecoming Celebration 7:30 p.m. A joyful reunion service welcoming back former 
members and friends. Join us for inspiring worship, testimonies, talented and gifted showcase, and a 
walk down memory lane as we kick off the weekend in praise and thanksgiving.   

Saturday, August 16 – Community Day (11:00 a.m. – 4:00 p.m.): A fun-filled outdoor community festival 
on the church grounds. Enjoy free food, delicious refreshments, and treats; rides and games for children 
moon bounce, face painting, and more; live music featuring our choir and local gospel artists; plus arts 
and crafts for all ages. Bring the whole family for a day of excitement, laughter, and community 
fellowship!   

Sunday, August 17 – Community Day Weekend Worship Service 10:50 a.m. a special morning service 
celebrating 98 years of faith and service. We will honor the legacy of Bishop Henry C. Brooks on his with 
a tribute and reflections on his vision. Come worship with us as we give thanks for God’s blessings 
through the years and unite in prayer for the future. Your presence will make this celebration even more 
meaningful.   

All events will be held at The Way of the Cross Church campus. 



 

 Activities & Highlights 

 

Free Food & Refreshments: Enjoy complimentary meals, snacks, and treats provided during our 
Community Day.   

Rides & Kids’ Activities: Children will love the moon bounce, games, and carnival-style fun set up on 
Saturday.   

Live Music & Entertainment: Uplifting gospel music, choirs, and possibly guest performers will keep the 
spirit celebratory.   

Arts and Crafts: Creative activities for kids and adults – make commemorative crafts and enjoy 
interactive art stations.   

 

We are excited to offer something for everyone throughout the weekend. Come ready to have fun and 
make lasting memories with old and new friends! 
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